
4 DAYS 240 4 DAYS 240 DAYS 240
X BONDS X X BONDS X BONDS

Demolition/replacement-exterior window/frame
LF
LF
LF
LF

QTY QTY

LF
LF
LF

$25.00
$25.00
$25.00

$3.50

$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00New siding to match existing

New Trim to match existing

$1,000.00

$20.00

$1,650.00

$6.50

$0.00

$0.00

Alternate No. 2:
Alternate No. 2A:
Alternate No. 3:
Alternate No. 3A:
Alternate No. 4:

LF LFLF

UNIT PRICES

Underground Sanitary Sewer Line
Underground Water Line
Underground Electrical Line

$65.00
$125.00
NO BID

LF

NO BID LF
LF

ITEM TOTALS
$309,392.00

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

$124,200.00
$129,000.00
$101,000.00

LFLF
QTY

BASE BID$326,000.00BASE BID$164,978.00

TOTALS

$85,920.00

TOTALS
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00

LF
LF

LF

BUILT RIGHT CONSTRUCTION LLC
SAVANNA, OK

***INCOMPLETE BID***

Bidder's Name:

City, State:

Alternate No. 1: $191,520.00

ALTERNATES

ADDENDA
AFFIDAVITS

ADDENDA
AFFIDAVITS

ADDENDA
AFFIDAVITS

TOTAL BASE BID

$30,000.00

State of Oklahoma
Office of Management and Enterprise Services        
Capital Assets Management
Construction and Properties Department

TAHLEQUAH, OK

BID TABULATION SHEET

Project Name:
Project Location:
Using Agency: PAUL HALEYProject Manager:

CAP Project Number:
Bid Date:

18058
07/26/18

ZENITH CONSTRUCTION CO.

Ft. Gibson Historical Site, Hospital Restoration Project
907 Garrison Ave., Ft. Gibson, OK 74434
Oklahoma Historical Society
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